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Villa for sale Villa For Sale

 

This substantial villa with sea views is located in the Magnolias zone of Cumbre del Sol.  can be accessed 
into the main hall via a few steps up to the front door from the street with parking available. There is also 
access from a double car port at the rear of the villa that leads up 13 steps to the pool level apartment and 
then a further staircase to the main villa. The main entrance leads into a large lounge/dining room with 
feature fireplace, comfortable sofas, a flat screen TV with some UK satellite channels, a DVD player, 
dining set and French doors leading to the terrace with incredible sea views. There is an attractive spiral 
staircase leading from the lounge to a galleried mezzanine area ideal for reading and relaxing with air 
conditioning. The independent modern fully fitted kitchen has range of eye and base level shaker style units 
and includes a range cooker, integrated dishwasher, large fridge/freezer and microwave. A door from the 
kitchen leads to a small terrace and steps down to the pool level. On the main level there are four 
bedrooms, two twins and two doubles all with fitted wardrobes. Both doubles and one twin bedroom have 
air conditioning. The two double bedrooms each share a bathroom with Jack and Jill style doors giving 
access from both or either room! This bathroom has a walk-in shower, WC, separate bath with shower over 
and twin sinks. The two twin bedrooms share a shower room with large walk-in shower, WC and wash 
hand basin. On this level there is large terrace for dining al-fresco overlooking the pool and with great sea 
views! A staircase leads down to the larger than average 10m x 5m private pool with Roman steps, hand 
rails and a poolside shower. From this level the independent two bedroom apartment is also accessed. It has 
doors leading straight out onto the pool area and consists of a comfortable lounge, kitchen and two further 
bedrooms, both doubles with air conditioning and a shower room with walk-in shower, WC and wash hand 
basin. There is a separate utility room on the pool level with the washing machine and a sink. The gardens 
are stepped and gravelled and filled with shrubs and fruit trees. On a clear day you can see the island of 
Ibiza from the terrace tooThis property is rented from the beginning of May until the end of September so it 
cannot be viewed during this period.
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Price: €595,000 
Bedrooms: 6
Bathrooms: 3
M2 Living: 2502

M2 Plot:  8002

M2 Terrace:  - 
Address:  Cumbre Del Sol,Alicante 


