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Villa for sale Villa For Sale

 

This traditional villa with a spacious, fully reformed, modern interior is located in the popular Valle del 
Portet area of Benitachell on the outskirts of Moraira. It is distributed over two floors and situated in 
terraced, easy maintenance garden. You enter through double gates onto a driveway with parking for four 
cars and an integral garage. From the parking area there are five easy steps up to the pool terrace and then a 
further six steps to the villa main entrance. You enter the villa into a spacious living/dining area which has 
access to an open terrace from where you can enjoy the views. Through an archway from the living area 
you enter a large kitchen/breakfast room including a gloss white kitchen fitted with black granite worktops. 
Through another archway in the living room you will find a double bedroom with en-suite bathroom 
including walk-in shower, a house shower room and a second double bedroom. Down a staircase in the 
breakfast area you will find a large under stairs storage cupboard and then the third bedroom. This bedroom 
is a spacious room with an en-suite bathroom with bath including shower attachment and a 
boiler/utility/storage room. Externally the garden has many terraces including plants, palms and fruit trees, 
a pool terrace including 10 x 4m pool, shower, barbecue and covered eating area.- Key points:- Built 
in1990 and reformed 2016- Quiet location with some sea views- Spacious and open modern interior- 
Furniture negotiable- New kitchen, bathrooms and tiles- Bathrooms all include vanity units- Kitchen with 
granite worktops- Built-in wardrobes in two bedrooms- Air conditioning hot/cold in two bedrooms- Double 
glazed windows and doors with some mosquiteras- Satellite television and internet- Connected to mains 
drains- Garage with workshop area and a large separate store room- 1km to a shopping centre- 4km to El 
Portet beach- 5km to the town and beaches of Moraira- A lovely villa, early viewing recommendedThis is 
just one of the many Spanish properties that we have to offer on the Costa Blanca in the Alicante province. 
If you are looking for an apartment, townhouse, villa, new build villa, country house or a plot to build your 
own property, we have them all, and we also offer a property finder service to help you find the property 
that is perfect for you. If you cannot find what you are looking for on our website please contact us with 
your criteria and your budget and we will do our very best to assist you.
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Price: €340,000 
Bedrooms: 3
Bathrooms: 3
M2 Living: 2662

M2 Plot:  10292

M2 Terrace:  - 
Address:  Benitachell,Alicante 


